
INVITATION FOR PRE-QUALIFICATION FOR TETFUND INTERVENTION IN LIBRARY 
DEVELOPMENT FOR YEARS 2015- 2016 MERGED FEDERAL COLLEGE OF EDUCATION 
(TECHNICAL) P.M.B. 1088, GUSAU ZAMFARA STATE 

 

(1.0)    INTRODUCTION: 

Applications are hereby invited from suitable and interested contractors with relevant experience 
and good track record for pre-qualification as prerequisite for tender in respect of 2015 and 
2016 Merged Tetfund library Development Intervention. 

Lot 1: Procurement of Assorted text Books and Reference Books. 

Lot 2: Procurement of Reference Materials and Journals. 

Lot 3: Supply of Computers and other accessories 

Lot 4: ICT facilities and Library Furniture 

(2.0)  PRE-QUALIFICATION REQUIREMENTS 

(a)  Evidence of Registration with Corporate Affairs Commission (CAC) with memorandum and 
Article of Association for Limited Liability Companies with up to date returns. 

(b) Evidence of registration on the National database of contractors, consultants and service 
providers (NDCCSP) provided by the Bureau of Public Procurement (BPP). 

(c) Tax Clearance Certificate for three (3) years (2015 – 2017). 

(d)  Audited Accounts for three (3) years (2015 – 2017). 

(e)  Company Profile which should include (i) Names of current Directors as registered with 
CAC (ii) Names, Qualification and Experience of key Personnel and (iii) List of Verifiable 
Projects successfully executed in the relevant area applied for pre-qualification for the 
immediate past three years. 

(f)  Bank Reference and Statement of Account for the last 12 months (February, 2016 to 
January, 2017). 

(g)  Certificate of compliance with Pension Reforms Act, 2004, issued by the Pensions 
Commission. 



(h)  Certificate of compliance with Section 6 (1) – (3) of the Industrial Training Fund Amendment 
Act, 2011, issued by the ITF. 

(i)   Evidence of Certificate of Compliance with Nigerian Social Insurance Trust Fund (NSITF) in 
accordance with employees compensation Act, ECA 2010 (Social Security Contribution, PPA 
Act Section 16.5.d). 

(j)    (i) A Sworn Court affidavit that: 

None of the Directors of the company or shareholder is present or former staff or official of 
Federal College of Education (Technical) Gusau, National Commission of Colleges of 
Education, Federal Ministry of Education (FME), Tertiary Education Trust Fund (TETFUND) and 
or Bureau for Public Procurement, (BPP) – Section 16 (51) or PPA Act. 

(ii) A sworn court affidavit of disclose of interest that none of the Directors is a serving or retired 
staff of TETFund, BPP and that none of the Directors of the Firm has been convicted in any 
court for any criminal offence including fraud and financial impropriety, 

(k)  A sworn court affidavit that the firm is not in receivership, insolvency, bankruptcy 
proceedings, winding up petition or proceedings and that all-information contained in the bid are 
true and correct. 

(3)  SUBMISSION OF PRE-QUALIFICATION DOCUMENTS 

All completed Technical/Pre-Qualification documents should be submitted on or before 
10.00a.m on 8 August 2018 in an envelope marked and indicated accordingly. The envelop 
should be sealed and marked: CONFIDENTIAL “TECHNICAL/PRE-QUALIFICATION 
DOCUMENTS FOR “ STATING THE NAME OF A PARTICULAR PROJECT APPLYING 
FOR” at the top left hand corner of the envelope: and also indicate the company’s name, 
telephone number and the mailing address at the reverse side of the envelop and address to: 

The Head of Procurement, 

Federal College of Education (Technical), Gusau 

Zamfara State. 

The college reserves the right to reject any or all pre-qualification submissions and or 
discontinue the tendering process at any time. Nothing in this advert shall be construed to be a 
commitment on the part of the college nor shall it entitle any potential tenderer to make any 
claims whatsoever and or seek an indemnity from the college on account of responding to this 
advert. The college shall not go into correspondence with non-pre-qualified contractors in any 
form. 



(4.0)  OPENING OF PRE-QUALIFICATION DOCUMENTS 

Pre-qualification documents will be opened on 8th August 2018 at 10.00am in the Council 
Chamber. Tenderers and the general public are hereby invited. 

Names of pre-qualified contractors will be published on the Notice Board of the college. 

TENDER DOCUMENTS 

Only contractors who have satisfied pre-qualification conditions above may be allowed to 
tender. 

SIGNED 

REGISTRAR 

 


